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A desirable chain free corner plot property with a spacious south
west facing lawned garden located within walking distance of
Hartford train station

Description
Purchased by the vendor twenty months ago this property has been
maintained throughout and is the ideal opportunity for a growing
family looking to implement their own personal stamp internally. 

Particular mention must be made of the new fascias, soffits,
guttering, panelling to the front aspect and the brand new en-suite
shower room. 

Externally the property is positioned on a corner plot with a large
double driveway and double detached garage with electric and eaves
storage to the front aspect with a side gate providing access to the
large lawned garden to the rear aspect.

Ground floor accommodation comprises storm porch through
hallway with understairs storage, stairs to the first floor and provides
access to the lounge, downstairs WC, dining room and kitchen. 

The bay fronted lounge measures over 19 ft by 10 ft with a feature
gas fireplace and French doors to the rear garden creating a light
and airy dual aspect reception room and presents potential to knock
through into the kitchen and extend, subject to planning permission,
to create a modern open plan kitchen/dining room with stunning
views over the rear garden. 

The dining room measures over 10 ft by 8ft with two double glazed
windows and could also be used as a play room/study. 

The kitchen has tiled flooring, a double glazed window to the rear
aspect, a uPVC door to the rear garden, a range of low level and eye
level units, one of which houses the conventional boiler, tiled
splashbacks, a selection of integrated appliances including an
extractor hood, four ring gas hob, double fan oven and provides
space for the American fridge/freezer, family sized dishwasher and
washing machine.

Upstairs comprises spacious landing with access to the partly
boarded loft space, a large built in storage cupboard which houses
the water tank, a principal bedroom with an en-suite shower, two
further double bedrooms, a three piece family bathroom and a single
bedroom/study. 

Hartford is an extremely desirable village in West Cheshire, home to
the renowned Grange School located within walking distance
followed by St Nicholas Catholic High School and Weaverham High
School which are only a short drive away. 

Nearby primary schools also include Hartford Primary School, The
Grange and Hartford Manor. 

Hartford Vil lage contains independent vi l lage shops, two
supermarkets, lovely cafes and restaurants, such as Chime and The
Hart of Hartford, all located within strolling distance. 

Moss Farm Sports Complex is just a short distance and local golf
clubs include Hartford, Sandiway and Vale Royal Abbey.


